

HARCROS CHEMICALS, INC.

8 CAPITOL STREET
NASHUA, NH 03063
603-880-0535

X-3011



10:30am

SOUTHEASTERN REGIONAL SERVICES GROUP
6 PARK ROAD
MANFIELD, MA 02048

BID: WATER & SEWER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

BID DUE DATE: APRIL 21, 2021

BID DUE TIME: 10:00 AM

SERSG Water Sewer Treatment Chemical IFB FY22
BID QUOTATION SHEET Bid Opening Date April 21, 2021

#	<u>Item Description</u>	<u>Bid Price</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total Quantity</u>	<u>Total Amount of Bid</u>
1	Liquid Potassium Hydroxide, gal/bulk (min. delivery 1,500)	\$ <u>4.8400</u>	per gallon	321,000 gallons	\$ <u>1,553,640.00</u>
		<u>Four</u>	dollars and	<u>eighty-four</u>	cents
2	Liquid Potassium Hydroxide, gal/bulk (min. delivery 750)	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	87,500 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
3	Liquid Potassium Hydroxide, 55 gal. drums	\$ <u>252.8500</u>	per drum	36 drums	\$ <u>9,102.60</u>
		<u>Two hundred fifty-two</u>	dollars and	<u>eighty-five</u>	cents
4	Sodium Fluoride, Coarse Crystals, lbs minimum delivery 40 bags	\$ <u>1.3500</u>	per pound	34,000 pounds	\$ <u>45,900.00</u>
		<u>One</u>	dollars and	<u>thirty-five</u>	cents
5	Hydrated Lime, lbs	\$ <u>0.2039</u>	per pound	300,000 pounds	\$ <u>61,170.00</u>
			dollars and		cents
6	Liquid Ferric Chloride, gal.	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	81,000 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
7	Sodium Bisulfite, gal.	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	5,000 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
8	Sodium Hydroxide 25% Solution, gal.	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	196,628 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
9	Sodium Hydroxide 50% Solution, gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	8,000 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents

Harcros Chemicals Inc. *Candice Secourt* 4/16/21
 Company Name -- Signature of Authorized Company Representative -- and date signed

Typ

BID QUOTATION SHEET Bid Opening Date April 21, 2021

#	<u>Item Description</u>	<u>Bid Price</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total Quantity</u>	<u>Total Amount of Bid</u>
10	Potassium Permanganate, priced per lb (in 5-gal pails)	\$ 1.6600	per pound	11,560 pounds	\$ 19,189.60
		One	dollars and	sixty-six	cents
11	Sodium hypochlorite 15% Solution, 5 gal. pails	\$ No Bid	per pail	810 pails	\$ No Bid
			dollars and		cents
12	Sodium hypochlorite 15% Solution, 15 gal. containers	\$ 35.7000	per container	1,067 containers	\$ 38,091.90
		Thirty-five	dollars and	seventy	cents
13	Sodium hypochlorite 15% Solution, 55 gal. drums	\$ 93.7500	per drum	526 drums	\$ 49,312.50
		Ninety-three	dollars and	seventy-five	cents
14	Sodium Hypochlorite 15% Solution, gal.s/bulk delivery	\$ No Bid	per gallon	171,267 gallons	\$ No Bid
			dollars and		cents
15	Polymer, in 275 gal totes, priced per lb (NE2276 equiv)	\$ No Bid	per pound	92,000 pounds	\$ No Bid
			dollars and		cents
16	Orthopolyphosphate (70/30 ortho/poly), 55 gal. drums	\$ No Bid	per drum	72 drums	\$ No Bid
			dollars and		cents
17	Citric Acid 50% solution, gallons (min. deliv 500 gal.)	\$ No Bid	per gallon	7,500 gallons	\$ No Bid
			dollars and		cents

Harcros Chemicals Inc. Candice Secourt 4/16/21
 Company Name -- Signature of Authorized Company Representative -- and date signed

SERSG Water Sewer Treatment Chemical IFB FY22
BID QUOTATION SHEET Bid Opening Date April 21, 2021

#	<u>Item Description</u>	<u>Bid Price</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Total Quantity</u>	<u>Total Amount of Bid</u>
18	Liquid Chlorine 99.5% (150-lb containers), priced per lb	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per pound	9,000 pounds	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
19	Polyaluminum Chloride, gallons (PCH-101 equiv.)	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	35,000 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
20	Polyaluminum Chloride, gallons (PCH-180 equiv.)	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	13,000 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
21	Ammonium Hydroxide 29%, 15-gallon poly pails	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per pail	100 pails	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
22	Sodium Aluminate, gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	15,000 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
23	Glycerin Based Supplemental Carbon, gal.	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	per gallon	100,000 gallons	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
			dollars and		cents
24	Sodium Chloride, food grade (50# bags) priced per lb	\$ <u>0.2350</u>	per pound	19,000 pounds	\$ <u>4,465.00</u>
		Zero	dollars and	twenty-three point	cents
				fifty	

Harcros Chemicals Inc. Candice Seewurt 4/16/21
 Company Name -- Signature of Authorized Company Representative -- and date signed

APPENDIX B: MUNICIPAL REFERENCES

List all municipalities in which you have had a contract for the Item on which you are bidding for the past two year period. References must include name and address of municipality, name and telephone number of key contact person.

1. Milford, NH Wastewater - 564 Nashua Street 03055 - Jim: 603-249-0664
2. Pennichuck Water - 200 Concord St., Nashua, NH 30061 - Jim: 603-913-2371
3. Wilmington Water - 121 Glen Road 01887 - Cliff: 978-658-4065
4. Newburyport Water - 157 Water St. 01950 - Robert: 978-465-4461
5. Ayer MA DPW - 25 Brook St. 01432 - Rick: 978-772-8240
6. Lebanon, NH - 193 Dartmouth College Hwy 03766 - Jim: 603-448-2514
7. Weymouth, MA - 120 Winter St. 02188 - Al: 781-337-5100
8. Penacook/Boscawen - 9 Woodbury Ln. 03303 - Peter: 603-545-5681
9. Kingston, RI Water - Ministerial Rd. 02892 - Henry: 401-783-5494
10. Bridgewater Power - Route 3 Ashland, NH 03217 - Peter: 603-968-9602

APPENDIX D: AFFIDAVIT OF CLERK OF CORPORATE BIDDER

I, please see attached, certify as follows:

1. I am the Clerk of _____ which is duly organized
Print exact name of Corporation
and incorporated under the laws of Massachusetts (or the State of _____ and is duly registered under M.G.L. Chapter 156D section 15.03 to do business in the Commonwealth of Massachusetts).

2. That the names, residential addresses and titles of the officers of the above-named corporation are as follows:

_____ President	_____ Vice President
_____ Address	_____ Address
_____ Treasurer	_____ Resident Agent (if a foreign corp.)
_____ Address	_____ Address

3. That the above-named corporation was incorporated on _____.

4. The federal tax I.D. number of said corporation is 43-1935062.

5. That the above-named corporation is in good standing with the Secretary of State of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts (or the State of _____) and, to my best knowledge and belief, has filed all state tax returns and paid all state taxes required by law. (M.G.L. Chapter 62 Section 49A)

6. _____ is authorized to sign contracts/agreements on behalf of _____ pursuant to a vote of the Board of Directors/
Print exact name of Corporation
Officers on _____.

Date
Signed under the pains and penalties of perjury this _____ day of _____, 20__.

Signature of Clerk



HARCROS

March 31, 2021

The Southeastern Regional Services Group
6 Park Row
Mansfield, MA 02048

To Whom It May Concern:

Please be advised that Candice Lecourt is hereby appointed, constituted and designated as agent and attorney-in-fact of the Corporation with full power and authority to act on behalf of this Corporation in all negotiations, bidding, concerns and transactions with the SERSG, or any of its agencies, departments, employees or agents. This includes the execution of all papers, documents, affidavits, bonds, sureties, contracts and acts and to receive and receipt thereof all purchase orders pertaining to the SERSG Bid FY 20 – July 1, 2021 - June 30, 2022 for Water and Sewer Treatment Chemicals.

Sincerely,

Mark Loethen

Mark Loethen
Vice President and CFO

UNANIMOUS WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF
HARCROS CHEMICALS INC.

05/21/2012

The undersigned, being all of the directors of Harcros Chemicals Inc., a Kansas Corporation (the "Corporation"), unanimously adopted at a duly called and held meeting of the Board of Directors at which a quorum was present and acting throughout:


RESOLVED that each of the persons be, and he hereby is, elected to the offices set opposite his name, to serve at the pleasure of the board of directors until the next annual election of officers by the board of directors or until his successor shall have been elected and qualified:

NAME	OFFICE
Kevin G. Mirner	President and Chief Executive Officer
Mark A. Loethen	Vice President and Chief Financial Officer, Treasurer
Peter P. Radford	Vice President Manufacturing, Secretary
Peter J. Savage	Chairman


RESOLVED that any one of the above named individuals is hereby authorized on behalf of this Corporation to execute, or to delegate the execution of, any and all contracts for the sale and supply of goods, wares and merchandise or the providing of services by the Corporation, such execution and delivery to evidence conclusively the approval thereof by the Board of Directors.



Peter J. Savage, Chairman



Kevin G. Mirner



Peter P. Radford



Mark A. Loethen

APPENDIX E: CERTIFICATION OF BID

The undersigned, under the pains and penalties of perjury, certifies that this bid has been made and submitted in good faith and without collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this section, the word "person" shall mean any natural person, business, partnership, corporation, union, committee, club, or other organization, entity, or group of individuals.

Harcros Chemicals Inc.

Name of Company

Candice Secor

Signature of Authorized Agent

April 16, 2021

Date



Southeastern Regional Services Group

ADDENDUM ONE issued 4/2/2021

WATER & SEWER TREATMENT CHEMICALS 7/1/2021 – 6/30/2022 IFB

This Addendum updates Medfield's Contact person, and North Attleborough's Quantity for item #23 Glycerin Based Supplemental Carbon. Revised pages 8, 19, and 23 are provided. All bidders for item #23 *must use* the corrected page 23 provided here.

ALL BIDDERS must acknowledge this Addendum below and include this page with their bid.

Addendum One Received & Acknowledged:

Signature *Carolee Severt* Date 4/21/21